City of Hudson

Request for City-wide Refuse Proposals
RFP's Opened: December 11, 2015

Republic Services
2800 S. Erie Sr.
Massillion, OH 44646

Kimble Recycling and Disposal
3596 State Route 39, NW

Dover, OH 44622

AA Sanitation
PO Box 1515
Stow, OH 44224

Waste Management of Ohio, Inc.
6705 Richmond Rd.
Glenwillow, OH 44139

Options Unit Price Preferred Hauler Prices
1-96 gal. refused and
64 gal. recycling Per Month / Per Quarter $16.62 $49.86 $22.25 $66.75 $21.00 $63.00 $24.00 $72.00
2 - 64 gal. refuse and 64
gal. recycling Per Month / Per Quarter $16.42 $49.26 $20.25 $60.75 No Bid $24.00 $72.00
3 - Bag Service weekly |Per Month / Per Bag $3.50 $2.00 $3.00 $3.00 $2.00 $4.50 $2.50
4 - Setback service Per Month / Per Quarter $28.62 $85.86 $42.25 $126.75 $35.00 $105.00 $42.00 $126.00
5 - Additional Options
Extra 96 gal - refuse $2.75 $3.00 N/A $3.00

64 gal - refuse $3.00 N/A N/A move to 96 gal

64 gal - recycling $3.00 N/A $3.00

Bulk items 1 item per week $10.00 / item N/A subject to volume and item
Options Unit Price Single Hauler Prices
1-96 gal. refused and
64 gal. recycling Per Month / Per Quarter $14.50 $43.50 $14.48 $43.44 No Bid $15.10 $45.30
2 - 64 gal. refuse and 64
gal. recycling Per Month / Per Quarter $14.30 $42.90 $13.48 $40.44 No Bid $15.10 $45.30
3 - Bag Service Weekly |Per Month / Per Bag $3.50 $2.00 $4.00 $2.00 No Bid $4.50 $2.50
4 - Setback service Per Month / Per Quarter $26.50 $79.50 $30.48 $91.44 No Bid $32.00 $96.00
5 - Additional Options
Extra 96 gal - refuse $2.75 $3.00 $3.00

64 gal - refuse $3.00 N/A move to 96 gal

64 gal - recycling $3.00 $3.00

Bulk items limited to 1item  per week $7.00 / item subject to volume and item

Days of Operation

Days of Operation will be Monday -

Thursdays
Company will need to negotiate

days as City is unequally populated

Exclusive Contract:

Monday

through Thursday with City divided

into 4 quadarants.

Routes:

3 refuse and 2
recycling- 1

2refuseand 1
recycling - 3
days

3 routes
South of Rt. 303

Monday: and West of
North of Rt. 303
and East of Stow
Road and East of

Darrow Rd.
North of Rt. 303

and West of
Darrow Rd.

Tuesday:

Wednesday:

Monday - Southeast (5 routes)

Tuesday - Southwest (2 routes)

Wednesday - Northeast (5 routes)

Wednesday - Northwest (5 routes)

Additional Remarks

2% increase on year 2

3% increase on year 3

*Will not charge additional fee for
setback service based on medical
needs

Annual increases based on CPI

not to exceed 3%

2.5% increase on year 2
2.5% increase on year 3




